BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Madison County, Mississippi

E-911 Administration Office 146 W. Center Street, Room 203, PO Box 608, Canton, MS 39046

Date:

To:

From:

Re:

T: (601) 859-6485 F: (601) 859-4743

March 5, 2013

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Butch Hammack

Road Claim

Germantown Rd.
Daniel Minters

Our office received a road claim for Daniel Minters on February 22, 2013. We have
investigated the incident and it is our office’s recommendation that this claim be paid in the

amount of $133.75 (the lessor of the two estimates). There is no documentation that supports

that the road was repaired within the allotted time per the Road Claim Policy.

Attached is paperwork regarding the claim for your viewing.



In order to process claim, please print & fill out completely, then return to Madison County Road Dept. or
Madison Co. EMA office along with two signed estimates for damages being claimed.

ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT

Personal

Information

Date: February 22,2013

Name: Daniel Minters

Mailing Address:

219 Germantown Road

Madison ,MS 39110

Contact #: 601.209.8934

Make/ Model of Vehicle: _2010 TOyota Tundra _

Incident

Information

Please answer questions below in relations to the incident being
reported:

05 2012 7:00am

Date: Time:

Location: North bound on Germantown Rd.

(name of road incident occurred)

Area Landmarks:near the Island on Germantown Rd.

Approx. Speed at time of incident: _20 to 25mph

Direction of Travel: NORTH on Germantown Rd.

Cause of Incident: _°% ~Hole

(ie: pothole, rock, etc..)

Area of vehicle damaged: passenger front wheel

Incident

Summary

Please write a brief summary of the incident (use back if needed):
In May I was driving North on Germantown Rd,when

my vehecle hit a pot-hole damaging the passenger

side wheel. Treported allthe information to Mr.
Hammack as requested,two estimates and copies of
bill and two to three weeks later I would contact
Mr. Hammack ,and reply would be that He report my
claim to the Board,so after nine months Idecided
to contact Mr. Hammack,Supervisor,Mr.Overby




2012-08-20 14:15

TOTAL - PART - WGT

.000

.000
.000
.000

161.

P038 * PIO PARTS INQUIRY *
V.I.N.: 5TFEM5F17AX018043 MODEL: 8259 EXT-CLR: 08T7 INT-CLR: FL44
PIO WEIGHT 71 LBs or 32 KGs
PIO - DESCRIPTION PART# PART-DESCRIPTION ISSUE-QTY
AD -
000159900701 FULL TANK GAS DECAL 1.000
AU T8Z - Toyota Auto Care (Synthetic 0il)
000159900907 ORP ID CARD 1.000
000159900911 ORP ROADSIDE ASSIST 1.000
000159900912 ORP AUTO CARE CARD 1.000
CF T8E - Owner Rewards Package
PT2063407243 FMAT SAND TUNDRA C D 1.000
CJ T8E - Owner Rewards Package
000157095401 09 TUN LACKS CHROME X¥.000
000157095402 CHROME FINISH WHEEL 4.000
DS T8E - Owner Rewards Package
000127079603 07 TUNDRA CREW MAX D 1.000
FS T32 - Vehicle Shield Package
F1 T1M - VIP Sales Follow-Up
* LIST CONTINUES - PF3=FWD *
PF2=SIGN-OFF PF3=FWD PF4=BWD PF8=RETURN

.950

800

.000

.200



SUPERIOR TIRE RECAPPERS, INC.

TIRES — TUBES — RECAPPING — VULCANIZING

3247 8. Liberty Street ® Phones 859-2432
P.O. Box 188 859-2433

CANTON, MISS. 39046-0188
1.5% FINANCE CHARGE AFTER 30 DAYS
c

ustomer's (0 (D (1} )
Order No., A Date i
Name X.anu,( M J WAMJ{:OJI

Address

Phone #

SOLD BY .0.D. CHARGE ON ACCT. MDSE. RETD. PAID OUT

| PRICE [ AMOUNT -

STATE WASTE TIRE FEE

‘Glaims and reftfncd Goods MUST be accomparied by ihis b

s B

' Y TAX 8 ’lS
1 /QQDO Recoived =y 139)15/

IATEEN Printing Co.  (601) 371-2567 21793




(B}

TOU AND

A

HERES s

4410 Highway 30 East
(601) 939-9955

712 South State Steet
(601) 353-5461

6895 Highway 49 North
(601) 296-0322

( Invoice Datc

INVOICE

Invoice No. | Time

o 3 ha ey 06/04/12

L

110 Dees Drive

09:01

(601) 607-5151

6012098934

DANIEL MINTERS
219 JERMANTOWN RD.
MADISON, MS 39110

Work Order No.

Mmeﬁ ﬁnwfz

535047

é_ual__é—s"mau k:l ngl_@mc Installer “‘_Eoﬁc’ation Payment ~Account Number
BUFORD JONES l !Reg #55- S 6012098934
Make & Model B ) Year ‘ Color Mileage 'i—‘agmNumber
TOYOTA TUNDRA 2010 IBLUE 59000
e — e L. el S IR B
Quanut\{ l’mt Number Description Umt Pl ice Total '
1 FEA2 2-WHEEL ALIGNMENT 69 .99 69.99
4 CBS ADHESIVE WEIGHT BALANCE 20.0Q 80.00

TICKETT IN QUOTE

* * PLEASE READ * *

TIGHTEN ALL LUGS 25 MILES AFTER SERVICE
NO REFUNDS
EXCHANGES ON APPROVAL OF MANAGER AND SUBJECT TO A

25% RESTOCKING CHARGE - MUST BE WITHIN 5 DAYS
’ Drw #: 55
90 DAY LAYAWAY NONREFUNDABLE WITH FORFEITURE OF DEPOSITS .
SHECINL ORDERS FA!D IN FULL IN ADVANCT User :DDL

SLUS FREIGHT AMD HANDLING - NO EXCHANGE OR REFUNDE
SPZCIAL GRDER AND PAINTE
OiSTRIBUTION CENTERS. =«

D {TEM - 2 WEEKS FROM OUR
VEEKS FROM FACTORY

AUTHORLIL Tl ABOVE RIPAIR WORK TO B DONE ALONG WITH NECESSARY MATERIAL
YOVt EMPLOY ! ES MAY OFERATI ABOVE vitiouE FOR PURPOSES CF TESTING

SalesAmoml ke

AUTHORIZED  RECEIVED 3Y

Deposit Amt
Balance Due

.00
160.49



Jennifer Taylor

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Jennifer Taylor <jennifer.taylor@madison-co.com>
Friday, May 03, 2013 10:29 AM

Shirley Brown (shirley.brown@madison-co.com)
Germantown Rd.

High

| have Lawrence standing here and he told me to ask you to pull the work order for the Germantown Rd. Intersection
work order and send it to me please ma’am. Think it was last year around May maybe?

Jenndifer Taylor
Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Emergency Management Office

0:601-855-5620
C:601-259-2260
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Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor <jennifer.taylor@madison-co.com>

Sent: Friday, May 10, 2013 4:42 PM

To: Shirley Brown (shirley.brown@madison-co.com); Hellen Keller (hkeller@madison-
co.com)

Cc: bhammack@madison-co.com

Subject: ROAD DAMAGE REPORTED

It was reported today there is a bad pothole on Germantown Rd. The caller gave the location to be approx.. 200 ft. south
of 215 Germantown Rd.

Thanks,

Jennifer Taylor
Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Emergency Management Office

0: 601-855-5620

C:601-259-2260



